
Page 1 www.tailbangers.com 12/3/2006

crude protein 
(min)  %

crude fat 
(min)  %

crude fiber 
(max)  %

moisture 
(max)  %

Original Bangers     
(Peanut Butter Flips)

whole wheat flour, whole rolled oats, 
canola oil, fresh ground peanuts, eggs, 
honey, cinnamon. (contains peanut 
butter coating)

12 10 1.8 10.5

Original Bangers     
(Howlin Yogurt)

whole wheat flour, whole rolled oats, 
canola oil, fresh ground peanuts, eggs, 
honey, cinnamon. (contains vanilla 
yogurt coating)

12 10 1.8 10.5

Original Bangers       
(Carob Crazy)

whole wheat flour, whole rolled oats, 
canola oil, fresh ground peanuts, eggs, 
honey, cinnamon. (contains carob 
coating)

12 10 1.8 10.5

Barkin Biscotti

whole wheat flour, flake oats, beef 
broth, canola oil, parmesan cheese, eggs, 
granulated garlic, oregano, vanilla 
yogurt or carob

10 15 0.75 10

Birthday Bundt Cakes    
with vanilla yogurt

flour, eggs, canola oil, whole rolled oats, 
fresh ground peanuts, honey, dried milk 
and vanilla yogurt coating

12 10 1.8 10.5

Cannoli's
flour, whole rolled oats, eggs, chicken 
broth, canola oil, parmesan cheese, 
garlic, oregano, vanilla yogurt

12 10 1.8 12.5

Doughnuts (coated)
flour, flake oats, cheddar cheese, bacon, 
yeast, water sufficient for baking, vanilla 
yogurt, peanut butter, or carob coating

15 8 0.5 0.1

Holiday Gift Box

whole wheat flour, whole rolled oats, 
canola oil, fresh ground peanuts, eggs, 
honey, cinnamon, vanilla yogurt, peanut 
butter or carob coatings

12 10 1.8 10.5

Pawcan Twirls

flour, flake oats,  fresh ground peanuts, 
honey eggs, canola oil, baking soda, 
cream cheese, cinnamon, water 
sufficient for baking, vanilla yogurt

12 10 0.75 12

Peanut Butter Muttins    
with vanilla yogurt

flour, eggs, canola oil, whole rolled oats, 
fresh ground peanuts, honey, dried milk 
and vanilla yogurt coating

12 10 1.8 10.5
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Pup Pastry

flour, flake oats, chicken broth, canola 
oil, eggs, baking soda, cheddar cheese, 
bacon, granulated garlic, oregano, 
vanilla yogurt

12 12 0.5 12

Seasonal Holiday Bulk

whole wheat flour, whole rolled oats, 
canola oil, fresh ground peanuts, eggs, 
honey, cinnamon, vanilla yogurt, peanut 
butter or carob coatings

12 10 1.8 10.5

Tail Waggers flour, flake oats, cheddar cheese, bacon, 
yeast, water sufficient for baking 15 8 0.5 0.1

Twist & Barks
flour, flake oats, parmesan cheese, 
chicken broth, granulated garlic, 
oregano, yeast with yogurt coating

12 5 0.5 12

Twist & Barks (coated)
flour, flake oats, parmesan cheese, 
chicken broth, granulated garlic, 
oregano, yeast, vanilla yogurt

12 5 0.5 12

Waggioli's

flour, flake oats, tomato sauce, canola 
oil, eggs, baking soda, cream cheese, 
parmesan cheese, granulated garlic, 
oregano

10 12 0.75 12


